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Environmental Data Analysis with MatLab is a new edition that expands fundamentally on the original with
an expanded tutorial approach, new crib sheets, and problem sets providing a clear learning path for students
and researchers working to analyze real data sets in the environmental sciences. Since publication of the
bestselling Environmental Data Analysis with MATLAB®, many advances have been made in
environmental data analysis. One only has to consider the global warming debate to realize how critically
important it is to be able to derive clear conclusions from often noisy data drawn from a broad range of
sources. The work teaches the basics of the underlying theory of data analysis and then reinforces that
knowledge with carefully chosen, realistic scenarios.

MATLAB®, a commercial data processing environment, is used in these scenarios. Significant content is
devoted to teaching how it can be effectively used in an environmental data analysis setting. This new
edition, though written in a self-contained way, is supplemented with data and MATLAB® scripts that can
be used as a data analysis tutorial.

New features include boxed crib sheets to help identify major results and important formulas and give brief
advice on how and when they should be used. Numerical derivatives and integrals are derived and illustrated.
Includes log-log plots with further examples of their use. Discusses new datasets on precipitation and stream
flow. Topical enhancement applies the chi-squared test to the results of the generalized least squares method.
New coverage of cluster analysis and approximation techniques that are widely applied in data analysis,
including Taylor Series and low-order polynomial approximations; non-linear least-squares with Newton’s
method;and pre-calculation and updating techniques applicable to real time data acquisition.

Provides a clear learning path for researchers and students using data analysis techniques which build upon●

one another, choosing the right order of presentation to substantially aid the reader in learning material
Includes crib sheets to summarize the most important data analysis techniques, results, procedures, and●

formulas, serving to organize the material in such a way that its sequence is more apparent
Uses real-world environmental examples and case studies formulated using the readily-available software●

environment in MATLAB®
Includes log-log plots with further examples of their use●
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From reader reviews:

Shawn Marsh:

Book will be written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A e-book Environmental Data Analysis with
MatLab will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about
anything. But some of you think this open or reading the book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why
they are often thought like that? Have you seeking best book or suited book with you?

Barbara Barnes:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important for people. The book Environmental Data Analysis with MatLab seemed to be
making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is quite
advantages for you. The e-book Environmental Data Analysis with MatLab is not only giving you
considerably more new information but also to be your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your own
personal spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship with all the book Environmental Data
Analysis with MatLab. You never really feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Keesha Marks:

Reading a book for being new life style in this year; every people loves to learn a book. When you read a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you would like get information about your examine, you can read education books, but
if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, along with
soon. The Environmental Data Analysis with MatLab offer you a new experience in looking at a book.

Kerry Giles:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Environmental Data Analysis with MatLab
can be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so out of date, spending your time by
reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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