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Sanity Check by Sharon Short first appeared in the Dayton Daily News (Ohio) in January 2002. For more
than ten years, the column covered everything from shredding pantyhose for stress relief, to the family dog
joyfully dancing with flying eggs, to the day Sharon realized she’d lost her lips. Sanity Check’s driving
philosophy is that we all goof up... but laughing at those goof-ups with each other is a lot healthier than
obsessing over them. This collection includes 100 favorite columns of Sanity Check readers. "Years ago,
when we were trying to create a local column in the Dayton Daily News’ Life section that offered a proper
mix of wisdom and whimsy, with a friendly voice and a bright take on the crazy things that can go on in in
the world, Sharon Short came quickly to mind. Her “Sanity Check” columns have been making our Monday
morning coffee taste better, and our days brighter, for more than a decade now. Those readers who know her
from her novels will enjoy getting to know the more personal, witty side of a writer who has true knack for
telling it like it is, and making you happy to hear it." Ron Rollins, Associate Editor, Dayton Daily News
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From reader reviews:

Preston Sloan:

Now a day those who Living in the era where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not involve people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals to
be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Examining a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information especially this Sanity Check book because
book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred percent guarantees there is
no doubt in it you probably know this.

Marsha Cox:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading you can get a lot
of information that could give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their reader with their story or
perhaps their experience. Not only the story that share in the books. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons or
daughters, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve
their talent in writing, they also doing some study before they write to the book. One of them is this Sanity
Check.

Carol Williams:

You may spend your free time to study this book this guide. This Sanity Check is simple to deliver you can
read it in the park your car, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not possess much space to bring
the particular printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save
the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Paula Daniels:

Some people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a publication. They are directly felt it when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose typically the book Sanity Check to make your current
reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading talent is developing when you including reading. Try to
choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the idea about book and studying
especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to open a book and examine it. Beside that the publication
Sanity Check can to be your brand-new friend when you're sense alone and confuse with the information
must you're doing of this time.
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